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The Remington 870 is the most popular shotgun in the world. It is used by
hunters, shooters, law enforcement officers, and military personnel all over
the globe. The 870 is known for its reliability, durability, and versatility. It is a
pump-action shotgun that can be chambered for a variety of cartridges,
from .410 bore to 3-inch magnum shells.

The Gun Digest of the Remington 870 is the definitive guide to this iconic
firearm. This comprehensive volume covers everything you need to know
about the Remington 870, from its history and design to its performance
and customization options.

History of the Remington 870

The Remington 870 was introduced in 1950. It was designed by John
Pedersen, who also designed the M1 Garand rifle. The 870 was an
immediate success, and it quickly became the most popular shotgun in the
United States.

The 870 has been used in a variety of military and law enforcement
applications. It was the standard issue shotgun for the U.S. military from
1966 to 1995. The 870 is also used by law enforcement agencies all over
the world.

Design of the Remington 870

The Remington 870 is a pump-action shotgun. This means that the user
must manually pump the forend after each shot to eject the spent shell and
chamber a new round.
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The 870 has a receiver made of aluminum alloy. The barrel is made of
steel. The stock and forend are made of wood or synthetic materials.

The 870 is available in a variety of configurations. The most common
configuration is the 12-gauge model with a 28-inch barrel. The 870 is also
available in 20-gauge, 16-gauge, and .410 bore models. Barrel lengths
range from 18 inches to 30 inches.

Performance of the Remington 870

The Remington 870 is a reliable and durable shotgun. It is capable of firing
thousands of rounds without malfunctioning.

The 870 is also a versatile shotgun. It can be used for a variety of
purposes, including hunting, shooting, self-defense, and home defense.

The 870 is a popular choice for hunters because it is a reliable and
accurate shotgun. The 870 is also a good choice for self-defense and home
defense because it is a powerful and easy-to-use shotgun.

Customization of the Remington 870

The Remington 870 is a highly customizable shotgun. There are a wide
variety of aftermarket parts and accessories available for the 870. This
allows users to customize their shotguns to meet their specific needs.

Some of the most popular aftermarket parts and accessories for the
Remington 870 include:

Barrels

Stocks



Forends

Sights

Magazines

Lights

Lasers

The Gun Digest of the Remington 870

The Gun Digest of the Remington 870 is the definitive guide to this iconic
firearm. This comprehensive volume covers everything you need to know
about the Remington 870, from its history and design to its performance
and customization options.

Whether you are a new or experienced shooter, The Gun Digest of the
Remington 870 is a must-have resource.
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